

Overview and Scrutiny – Draft Work Programme 2014 - 2015

Meeting Dates

<u>Date</u>	<u>Panel Pre-Brief</u>	<u>Meeting</u>	<u>Venue</u>
2 June 2014	2.00pm	2.30pm	Council Chamber
14 July 2014	2.00pm	2.30pm	Council Chamber
1 September 2014	2.00pm	2.30pm	Council Chamber
13 October 2014	2.00pm	2.30pm	Council Chamber
24 November 2014	1.30pm	2.30pm	Council Chamber
Additional Meeting 15 December 2014	1.30pm	2.30pm	Council Chamber
Additional Meeting 5 January 2015	9.30am	10.00am	Council Chamber
19 January 2015	1.30pm	2.30pm	Council Chamber
Additional Meeting 9 February 2014	2.00pm	2.30pm	Council Chamber
23 February 2015	2.00pm	2.30pm	Council Chamber
13 April 2015	2.00pm	2.30pm	Council Chamber

ADDITIONAL MEETING

Monday 15 December 2014

Time	Agenda Item	Fenland Corporate Priority	Portfolio Holder/ Officer/ External Witness
13.30 to 14.30 Pre Briefing session			
14.30 to 16.30 Meeting	Accommodation Review		Paul Medd, Gary Garford, Rob Bridge

ADDITIONAL MEETING

Monday 5 January 2015

Time	Agenda Item	Fenland Corporate Priority	Portfolio Holder/ Officer/ External Witness
9.30 to 10.00 Pre Briefing session			
10.00 to 12.00 Meeting	Community House		Alan Pain, Dan Horn Councillor Cornwell
	Grass Cutting Review Report		Richard Cassidy, Phil Hughes

Monday 19 January 2015

Time	Agenda Item	Fenland Corporate Priority	Portfolio Holder/ Officer/ External Witness
13.30 to 14.30 Pre Briefing session	Draft Overview and Scrutiny Future Work Programme 2015/2016	Quality Organisation	Councillor Mrs French, Anna Goodall
14.30 to 16.30 Meeting	Grass Cutting Review – The Landscaping Group		Richard Cassidy, Phil Hughes
	Fees and Charges including Leisure	Quality Organisation	Councillor Seaton Cabinet Rob Bridge, Mark Saunders
	Draft Corporate Plan and Budget	Quality Organisation	Cabinet CMT
	Future Work Programme 2014/2015	Quality Organisation	Councillor Mrs French, Anna Goodall

ADDITIONAL MEETING

Monday 9 February 2015

Time	Agenda Item	Fenland Corporate Priority	Portfolio Holder/ Officer/ External Witness
14.00 to 14.30 Pre Briefing session			
14.30 to 16.30 Meeting	Roddons		Alan Pain, Dan Horn Anne Brighton - Roddons
	Wisbech 2020 Vision Update		Councillor Clark Carol Pilson, Jo Blackmore
	March Footbridge		Gary Garford
	Draft Overview and Scrutiny Future Work Programme 2015/2016	Quality Organisation	Councillor Mrs French, Anna Goodall

Monday 23 February 2015

Time	Agenda Item	Fenland Corporate Priority	Portfolio Holder/ Officer/ External Witness
14.00 to 14.30 Pre Briefing session			
14.30 to 16.30 Meeting	Progress of Corporate Priority – Communities	Communities	Councillor Tanfield and Councillor Butcher Alan Pain, Richard Cassidy, Dan Horn, Phil Hughes, Val Thomas
	Local Health Partnership Update		Councillor Cornwell Richard Cassidy Val Thomas NHS Cambridgeshire
	Draft Overview and Scrutiny Future Work Programme 2015/2016	Quality Organisation	Councillor Mrs French, Anna Goodall